
 

 

 

Lesson Plans that Work 
Year C – Third Sunday in Lent 

Lesson Plans for Younger Children 

Scripture: Luke 13:1-9 

The Lord is full of compassion and mercy: Come, let us adore him. (Antiphon for Lent, Book of 
Common Prayer, page 81.) And what if, during this season of Lent, we sought a deeper 
understanding of this amazing gospel of grace? Will that image of grace energize us to do the 
spiritual housekeeping we need to be ready for the "new thing" God is doing in Easter?  
 
A notation for this week's Gospel  
To repent means to turn or return after seeing what you have done or not done is wrong. It is a 
change of mind – turning away from the evil ways, toward the good ways.  The first part of 
today’s Gospel may seem like another version of the age-old question: why are some people 
killed in bizarre accidents — and others amazingly spared?  
 
However, today’s lesson is not about good guys or bad guys, but rather about turning your life 
around so you are ready to meet God.  It is about feeding our souls with the good, nurturing 
ourselves so we will produce good things, and turning over the soil of our lives so we can begin 
again and again.  
 
Theme: Called to repentance 
 
Before Class: You will need paper and crayons. The story is about a fig tree, so if you are up to 
it you can bring figs in for the children to see and taste. Fig Newtons might be a fun snack if you 
are having snack today. 
 
The story for today includes a little tree, which is the portion of Scripture we will use. Consider a 
couple of options. One option is to bring to class sufficient little plants in pots that the children 
could care for and that could go home with the children the Sunday before Easter (or even 
Easter, if you wanted, in which case you would need to have a few extra on hand for children 
that will show up on Easter). Someone in your church should monitor the plants during the week 
to be sure they do not get too dry. If this seems unwieldy, consider either a plant that could be 
planted in your churchyard when weather permits, or simply bring a plant from your own home 
for a visit this one Sunday. Also bring a pitcher to water the plant(s) and a bit of plant food.  
 
Follow up from Lent 2: If the hen and chicks went home with you for safe keeping last week, be 
sure to bring them back along with containers (little boxes if you have them or lunch bags with 
paper toweling to wrap the chicks). You will need the leftover clay, in case you have a new child 
this Sunday. 
 
Beginning: Help the children find their hens and chicks, play with them a bit, if they want, and 
then pack them gently so they can go home with the children today. If, by any chance, a new 
child has appeared, let them make their own hen and chicks to be wrapped carefully to go home. 



 

 

 

Praying: Loving God, we thank you for helping us see you and know you in many ways.  Help 
us see you today. Amen. 
 
The Story: Luke 13: 6-9 (Note: we will only use the second half of today’s scripture.) 
Jesus had many stories to tell people so they could better understand what God wants us to do. 
The story I want to tell you about today is about a little tree. This little tree was supposed to 
produce lots of figs, a kind of fruit that the people in Jesus' country really liked to eat. But this 
tree had not produced even one little fig. The owner of the fig tree said, "Cut that silly tree down.  
It is wasting the soil it is planted in if it doesn't produce any fruit." The gardener loved the little 
tree and was sad. "Tell you what," he said to the man. "Give it one more chance. I will loosen up 
the soil around it and give it some plant food and then let's see what happens. Give it one more 
chance." 
 
Activity: If you have brought individual plants, show the children how to ever so gently dig with 
their finger a little ditch in a circle around the stem of the little plant; a very shallow little ditch. 
Then show them how to mix the plant food with the water, and pour just a little bit into the ditch. 
If water starts to run out of the bottom of the pots, the plant has enough water.  
 
If you have brought just the one plant, have the children work together to fashion a ditch for the 
plant and then gently pour the water with plant food in on the plant. (Optionally, if you are in a 
warm environment, you could take the children outside and let them dig around some of the 
plants in your church garden, feed the plants and water them.)  
 
Tell the children your plan for the plants (they will go home with the children on a certain day, or 
the plant will be planted in the church yard when the weather permits; etc.) 
 
Activity: Give the children paper and crayons and ask them to draw the plant and color it as they 
wish, so we will have these pictures to put in the basket on our altar. You could also invite them 
to draw what important things are needed for a plant to grow (sun, dirt, water, food, etc.) 
 
Getting Closure: Get the chicks ready to go home with the children. Gather the children around 
the altar, lighting the candle if you choose. Read the prayer you composed together on the first 
Sunday in Lent and ask the children if there is anything else they want to add to the prayer or 
change about it. If you did not write a prayer on the first Sunday in Lent, you can use the prayer 
below. 
 
Closing Prayer: Close using the prayer you and the children created on the First Sunday in Lent, 
or you can use the following prayer. 
Loving God, thank you for always giving us another chance, like you gave the plant another 
chance. Help us to grow in our love of you and help us to feed those that need to be fed.  Amen. 
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